RESOLUTION 81-22
RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING AWARDING OF CONTRACT FOR
VARIOUS WATER MAIN COMPONENTS IN THE BOROUGH OF CLLAYTON
(CATERINA)
WHEREAS, pursuant to due notice and advertisement as required by law, the Borough
of Clayton received bids on March 22, 2022 for the purchase of Various Water Main
Components; and

WHEREAS, Caterina Supply Inc., of Williamstown, New Jersey was the successful low

bidder as to the items set forth below:

MEGALUGS:

4” EBAA Megalug complete for PVC 48.81
6” EBAA Megalug complete/PVC 62.26
8” EBAA Megalug complete/PVC 83.38
10” EBAA Megalug complete/PVC 141.63
12” EBAA Megalug complete/PVC 149.06
TOTAL - AWARD CATEGORY 2 485.14
PIPE/PVS

100 LF — 6 C-900 PVC DR18 1,372.00
100 LF - 8” C-900 PVC DR18 2,352.00
100 LF — 10” C-900 PVC DR 18 3,530.00
100 LF - 127 C-900 PVC DR18 4,970.00
TOTAL PVS - AWARD CATEGORY 3 12,224.00
PIPE/DUCTILE IRON

100 LF — 6” DIP CL52 2,665.00
100 LF — 8” DIP CL52 3,760.00
100 LF — 10” DIP CL52 4,926.00

100 LF — 12” DIP CL.52 6,206.00



TOTAL DIP - AWARD CATEGORY 4 17,557.00

WHEREAS, the specifications and bids were for unit prices only, thereby resulting in
“open-ended contracts” which make it impossible to determine the exact amount of funds which
will be expended pursuant thereto, thereby requiring no certification of availability of funds at
this time

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Mayor and Council of the Borough
of Clayton, County of Gloucester and State of New Jersey that Caterina Supply Inc., of
Williamstown, New Jersey, be and hereby is awarded the contract for the items as set forth above,
for the unit bid prices submitted by said bidder for said items, as tabulated in the Summary of
Bids attached hereto and made a part hereof, in accordance with and pursuant to the specifications
promulgated by the Borough of Clayton,

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that before any purchase can be made pursuant to the
within award, a certification must be obtained from the Borough Chief Financial Officer
certifying that sufficient funds are available at that time for that particular purchase and
identifying the line item of the Borough of Clayton Water & Sewer Budget out of which said
funds will be paid.

ADOPTED at a regular council meeting of the Mayor and Council of the Borough of

Clayton, County of Gloucester and State of New Jersey held on March 24, 2022.

BOROWON

THOMAS BIANCO, Mayor

ATTEST: ;

( %w( b@ﬁfmmr

CHRISTINE NEWCOMB, Borough Clerk




BOROUGH OF CLAYTON

BID SUMMARY - RESULTS

March 22, 2022

Various Water Main Components (Pricing - 04/01/2022 - 12/31/2022)

Caterina
MEGALUGS:
4" EBAA Megalug complete for PVC 48.81
6" EBAA Megalug complete/PVC 62.26
8" EBAA Megalug complete/PVC 83.38
10” EBAA Megalug complete/PVC 141.63
12” EBAA Megalug complete/PVC 149.06
TOTAL — AWARD CATEGORY 2 485.14

Caterina
PIPE/PVC
100 LF - 6" C-900 PVC DR18 1,372.00
100 LF - 8" C-900 PVC DR18 2,352.00
100 LF - 10” C-900 PVC DR18 3,530.00
100 LF - 12” C-900 PVC DR18 4,970.00
TOTAL PVC - AWARD CATEGORY 3 12,224.00

Caterina
PIPE/DUCTILE IRON
100 LF - 6" DIP CL52 2,665.00
100 LF - 8” DIP CL52 3,760.00
100 LF - 10” DIP CL52 4,926.00
100 LF - 12” DIP CL52 6,206.00
TOTAL DIP - AWARD CATEGORY 4 17,557.00




BOROUGH OF CLAYTON
BID SUMMARY - RESULTS
March 22, 2022

Various Water Main Components (Pricing - 04/01/2022 - 12/31/2022)

GATE VALVES;

4” Mueller Gate Valve or Equal
6” Mueller Gate Valve or Equal
8” Mueller Gate Valve or Equal
10" Mueller Gate Valve or Equal
12" Mueller Gate Valve or Equal
TOTAL - AWARD CATEGORY 1

MEGALUGS:

4" EBAA Megalug complete for PVC
6” EBAA Megalug complete/PVC

8” EBAA Megalug complete/PVC
10" EBAA Megalug complete/PVC
12” EBAA Megalug complete/PVC
TOTAL - AWARD CATEGORY 2

PIPE/PVC

100 LF - 6" C-900 PVC DR18

100 LF - 8” C-900 PVC DR18

100 LF - 10" C-900 PVC DR18

100 LF - 12" C-900 PVC DR18
TOTAL PVC - AWARD CATEGORY 3

PIPE/DUCTILE IRON

100 LF - 6" DIP CL52

100 LF - 8” DIP CL52

100 LF - 10” DIP CL52

100 LF - 12" DIP CL52

TOTAL DIP - AWARD CATEGORY 4

Unit Cost
Caterina | Ferguson | Kennedy
640.23 622.00 623.00
816.62 798.00 795.00
1,300.62 | 1,270.00 | 1,266.00
2,027.92 1,985.00 1,975.00
2,566.06 2,512.00 2,499.00
7,35145 | 7,187.00 fF
Unit Cost
Caterina | Ferguson | Kennedy
48.81 62.00 66.00
62.26 75.00 85.00
83.38 100.00 114.00
141.63 159.00 193.00
149.06 170.00 203.00
- |  566.00 661.00
Unit Cost
Caterina | Ferguson Kennedy
1,372.00 1 1,487.00 1,800.00
2,352.00 2,550.00 3,100.00
3,530.00 3,825.00 4,600.00
4,970.00 5,400.00 | 6,500.00
12 B 13,262.00 | 16,000.00
Unit Cost .
Caterina | Ferguson | Kennedy
2,665.00 | no bid 3,700.00
3,760.00 | no bid 5,200.00
4,926.00 | no bid 6,800.00
6,206.00 | no bid 8,600,00
- | 2430000




MJ FITTINGS
6”-1/16 to 1/4 bend
8”-1/16to 1/4
10”-1/16 to 1/4
12"-1/16to 1/4
6X6X6 TEE

8X8X6 TEE

8X8X8 TEE

10X10X6 TEE
10X10X8 TEE
10X10X10 TEE
12X12X6 TEE
12X12X8 TEE
12X12C10 TEE
12X12X12 TEE
TOTAL - AWARD CATEGORY 5

STOPS/FITTINGS/ADAPTERS/MISC
1” Mueller Corp Stop X Compression or Equal
1” Curb X Compression

1” Curb Stop IPS X Comp

1" IP X Comp Adapter

%" IP X Comp Adapter

1” Comp Union

%" Comp Union

Adjustabile Valve Box

4’ AY Domestic Curb Box W/Rod

1 X 100" CTS 250 PSI Poly Pipe
TOTAL - AWARD CATEGORY 6

HYDRANTS- MUELLER CENTURIAN A-423 3 WAY NST or Equal = ' . | 0

Hydrant 4 %2’ Bury 4" Storz nozzle w/cap
(HARINC-HP-45-NH-CAP)
TOTAL - AWARD CATEGORY 7

Unlt Cosf

Caterina | Ferguson | Kennedy
141.41 |  155.00 | 1791100
206.28 | ' 22500  260.00
358.25 | - 390.00 |  452.00
518.08 | | 562.00f 65400
203.93 | . 22000f 25700}
1 255.10 25000 322,00
29226 | © 29200}  382.00
382.84 |  36500|  500.00
466.11 | 420.00 | 588.00.
52832| = 470.00|  667.00
478.71| . 42000  605.00
50548 |  450.00|  638.00
636.18 590.00/|  804.00
666.10 | | 590.00}  842.00

5,639.05 7,150.00

Unit Cost

Caterina | Ferguson | Kennedy
84.29 78.00 78.00
136.41 131.00 126.00
151.04 144.00 139.00

33.89 32.00 31.00
23.69 23.00 22.00
27.01 26.00 25.00
24.75 23.00 23.00
270.00 195.00 |  296.00
65.17 53.00 76.00
71.00 4600 |  150.00

966.00

Umt Cost \

Caterina | Ferguson | Kennedy

3,160.83

3,198.00 |

3,160.83

3,198.00




